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Need a manual for your Truma Trumatic S 3002 /
S 5002 furnace where can i find the

thermocouple on the trumatic s3002p trumatic
gas heater the bulb of the thermocouple should

sit close to the pilot light in the burner. Basically,
the Truma Combi is the best bargain in a Truma.
It isnt quiet, its not going to be affordable with all
the extras, but it is a reliable, efficient, and cost-
effective propane heater and water heater. With
only a small investment, you can save hundreds
of dollars over a propane heater and gas water
heater system, which are typically for around

                               1 / 6

http://widesearchengine.com/combing/?loggia=VHJ1bWEgVHJ1bWF0aWMgUyA1MDAyIEluc3RhbGxhdGlvbiBJbnN0cnVjdGlvbnMgTWFudWFsIFRydW1hVHJ&ZG93bmxvYWR8WHU4TVd4dVlYbDhmREUyTmpnNE56WTVOelY4ZkRJMU9UQjhmQ2hOS1NCWGIzSmtjSEpsYzNNZ1cxaE5URkpRUXlCV01pQlFSRVpk=bruckheimer&unmissed=


 

$1200 per unit. With this setup, you will be able
to stay warm in and around your vehicle while
the unit is operating. This setup can easily run
you around $800 in your own home, where you
will use it an average of three or four hours a
day. Its not like other propane water heaters,
which usually run in the $500-$600 range per

unit. The icing on the cake is the Truma Combi,
which only costs around $2,000 in comparison.
The unit comes with several accessories, all are
capable of being added on top of the unit, and
your initial investment will be covered by the

manufacturers 10 year warranty. The installation
of the trimac s 5002 is as simple as you can

imagine. The unit comes as a kit with everything
you need to get it installed. It comes with all of
the accessories that youll need, the included
instructions, the accessories, and the actual

trimac s 5002. The only extra piece of equipment
youll need to buy is a propane tank (we

recommend the atlas 5000), which you can get in
a variety of sizes. These tanks are readily

available at a variety of outlets, which makes
selecting the right size easy for you. The trimac s
5002 is capable of storing up to 5000 gallons of
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propane, which will last an estimated 6 years.
Before you decide to install the trimac s 5002,
however, youll want to decide how you plan to

control it. The trimac comes with two main
methods of control, which are the trimac plus

plus and trimac cp. Each control method has its
advantages and disadvantages. As stated earlier,

the trimac plus plus is a digital control panel,
which is very easy to use once you get the hang
of it, but the trimac cp does not require you to

purchase any additional equipment to be able to
control the trimac.
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Another key feature of the Truma Combi is the
Truma Trumatic exhaust venting system. This

system utilizes the furnace to provide the
exhaust. This means that the water heater is

essentially off when the furnace is on. The Truma
Combis exhaust fan is on all the time, venting hot
air directly outside. In fact, the ducting runs the
length of the unit, so youd never need to worry

about an icy exhaust vent. (A word of caution, do
not vent the system directly inside your RV. If it
gets cold, youll need to vent out the window. If

your RV isnt insulated well, venting directly inside
may eventually cause your interior insulation to

rot away.) The Truma Combi uses a patented
automatic flame booster system to increase the
output of the furnace. This means that when the

furnace is off, you wont need to pay high gas fees
for the appliance. The system automatically kicks
in when the heat exchanger and water tank are

both hot, allowing the burner to begin outputting
heat at an elevated rate. The rate at which heat

is output by the system is increased in a cycle up
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to the maximum temperature setting of the
appliance. The exact routine can be controlled by
turning a switch on the wall. The colder you are,
the hotter a heater must be to get you hot. The

Truma Combis heat output range is from 1500 to
2400 ( and should be set to at least 1900 ) to

keep your camper comfortable. You can give it
more by bumping the fan speed up to a higher

RPM of 1350 ( and be sure the fan is on the
burner/heater case). You can also adjust the

temperature to -30 C to +10 C, but then the unit
wont work as a heater if you set the cooler

temperature to -20 C as its too cold to operate
the furnace. You can also make it hot as a heater
when its not working, by simply setting it to its
most powerful setting, 2400 W and running the
fan at it full speed. The unit is set at a constant
temperature, not the setting that is manually
adjustable. We have it set at 1900, which is a

fairly high setting, but its been fine, maybe a bit
high for some, but then the Truma Combi isnt for

everyone. It might even be too high in your
camper. This unit gets hot, but its not too hot to
touch. If the fan is off, it will be a warm oven-like
setting, and nothing wrong with that. Its a good
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way to beat the cold out of a camper. 5ec8ef588b
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